
Item No. Mfg Stock No. Description Total Order Unit Price Total Price

1 AAG G470-00
DayMinder Brand, Monthly Planner 11-7/8" x 7-

7/8", 1 mo/2 page spread         
12 $9.99 $119.88

2 AAG G520-00
DayMinder Brand, Weekly, 8" x 11", 1 wk/2 page 

spread, recycled paper
2 $13.99 $27.98

3 AAG G595-00
DayMinder Brand, Weekly,  8" x 8 1/2", 1 wk/2 

page spread, recycled paper
1 No Bid N/A

4 AAG 70-950-05
Appointment Book, 10-7/8" x 8-1/4", 1 week/2 

page spread

5 AAG 70-260-05
Monthly Planner, 9" x 11", 13 month, unruled 

blocks

6 AAG SK2-00
DayMinder Brand Monthly Planner;7 7/8" x 11 

7/8", 14 months

7 AAG SD389-13
Standard Diary - 6" x 8 3/4" x 1"; Red; One day per 

page
1 $22.99 $22.99

8 AAG SK48-00
Pocket Calendar 3 /12" x 6 3/16", one week/two 

page spread

9 AAG 70-864-05
Daily Planner 8 1/2" x 11"; printed on quality paper 

containing 30% post-consumer waste; 12 months
5 No Bid N/A

10 HOD-5226 Ruled Monthly Planner 

11 AAG-G400H-00 Monthly Planner 4 $10.99 $43.96

12 AAG-G545-00 Planner-Black-DayMinder 

13 AAG-G545-50 Planner Refills - Day Minder 

14 EL70-905-22 Monthly Planner

Item No. Mfg Stock No. Description Total Order Unit Price Total Price

1 AAG PM1-28 One Month Per Page,  8" x 11" 4 $6.99 $27.96

2 AAG PM2-28 One Month Per Page, 12" x 17" 9 $6.99 $62.91

3 AAG PM3-28 One Month Per Page, 15 ½" x 22 3/4" 5 $8.99 $44.95

4 AAG  PM6-28 Three Months Per Page, 15 1/2" x 22 3/4" 18 $11.99 $215.82

5 AAG  PM12-28 One Year Per Page, 24" x 36", blue ink 24 $9.99 $239.76

6 VIO A1102
Mo/Quarterly Write On/Wipe Off Organizer, 24" x 

36", includes black pen

7 AAG PM200-28
Reversible/Erasable Dated Wall Planner, 36" x 

24", Horizontal, Yearly
1 $16.99 $16.99

8 AAG-4-28 One Month Per Page 20" x 30" wall 2 No Bid N/A

9 AAG-K1-00 "Today-Is" Wall Calendar, 6-5/8"

10 AAG-PM326-28 Eraseable Yearly Calendar, 48" x 32" 13 $19.99 $259.87

11 AAG-PM326-28 32 x 48 Wall Calendar
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Item No. Mfg Stock No. Description Total Order Unit Price Total Price

1 HOD-180-HD
Executive Monthly, 24" x 19", non refillable, 12 

months
3 No Bid N/A

2 AAG  SK24-00
Non refillable, 22" x 17", 1 month/page, ruled daily 

blocks
33 $4.25 $140.25

3 HOD 140-HD 4 corner, refillable with HD 142, 22" x 17"

4 AAG SK25-17 Non refillable,  22" x 17", blue 1 No Bid N/A

5 HOD-150-HD Monthly Non-refillable;perf shts 1 No Bid N/A

6 AAG SK31
19 1/8" x 24"; 12 months, ruled block size: 3 1/4" x 

2 3/4"; one month per page
2 No Bid N/A

7 AAG SW200-00
21 3/4" x 17", Unruled blocks; wide black 

headband, black corners

8 AAG SK800 Desk/Wall Calendar Refill

9 AAG SK14
Compact Desk Pad, 17-3/4"x10-7/8" Unruled 

blocks 
6 $5.99 $35.94

Item No. Mfg Stock No. Description Total Order Unit Price Total Price

1 AAG  E017-50
2-Color Refill,  3 1/2" x 6",  2 pages/weekday, 12 

months
1 No Bid N/A

2 AAG  E210-50
Daily Desk Calendar Refill, 4-1/2" x 7-7/8', 2 

pages/weekday

3 AAG  E717-50 Daily 1-Color Refill,  3-1/2" x 6", 2 pages/day 1 $7.99 $7.99

4 AAG E919-50
Compact daily, Refill, 3" x 3 3/4", 2 pages/day, 

unruled
3 $7.49 $22.47

5 AAG SW705X-50
Flip-a-week Desk Calendar, Weekly refill, 5-5/8" x 

7"
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