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JOINT PURCHASING COUNCIL - 2021 JANITORIAL SUPPLIES PRELIMINARY BID TABULATION 
BID OPENED 2:00 p.m. - JANUARY 6, 2021 

AWARDED VENDORS ARE IN YELLOW 
 

Dark shaded items have 0 quantity for this bid.  All current manufacturer’s product specifications must be supplied for the item to be considered.  Sample must match product specified and product delivered.

   

Paper Towels 

Item 
# Description No. of 

Cases Vendor Manufacturer & 
Brand 

Stock 
Number Color Ply 

Sheet Size 
Roll 

Size, Core Size 
(W X L) 

Post-Consumer 
Content % 

Items 
Per 
Pkg 

Pkgs 
Per 

Case 
Items/ 
Ft. Per 
Case 

Bid 
Case 
Wt. 

Net Cs Wt in 
lbs. 

Determined 
from 

Provided 
Sample 

Number 
of 

Cases 
Case 
Price Total Price 

Price Per 
Ounce of 

Paper 

101 

Brown Single 
Fold Towel 

SK1850A Essity Tork 
Universal 

10.25" x 9.13", 250/pkg., 16 
pkgs./case, 4,000 
towels/case, 100% recycled 
fiber/ 
40% post-consumer fiber, 
Gross Cs. Wt. 20.64 lbs., 
Net Cs. Wt. 19.05 lbs.,  
Chlorine free, EcoLogo 
Certified, EPA compliant, or 
equal quality/size product 

335 

Greenwood Nittany 12344 Brown 1 10.25” x 9.25” 100 250 16 4000 22 21.22 335 $15.40 $5,159.00 $0.0454 
Great Western Supply Essity SK1850A Brown 1 9.125” x 10.25” 40 250 16 4000 20.6 18.82 335 $14.92 $4,998.20 $0.0496 
Midland Paper Essity Tork SK1850A Brown 1 9.125” x 10.25” 50 250 16 4000 19 18.34 335 $15.88 $5,319.80 $0.0541 
Midland Paper Right Choice 78000013 Brown 1 9” x 9.45”  250 16 4000  16.38 335 $14.88 $4,984.80 $0.0568 
JP Gasway Nova 2755K Brown  9.45” x 9” 100 250 16 4000 17.28 17.62 335 $16.14 $5,406.90 $0.0573 

BL Murray Vondrehle 540-K Kraft  9.25” x 10.25”  250 16 4000 22 19.24 335 $22.58 $7,564.30 $0.0734 

White Distribution and 
Supply 

Universal 0631337 Brown 1 10.25” x 9.5” 40 250 16 4000 20 16.01 335 $23.1250 $7,746.875 $0.0903 

102 

Brown Multi 
Fold Towel 

MK520A Essity Tork 
Universal 

9.5" x 9.13", 250/pkg, 16 
pkgs/case, 4,000 
towels/case, 100% recycled 
fiber/50% post-consumer 
fiber, Gross Cs. Wt. 19.07 
lbs., Net Cs. Wt. 17.66 lbs., 
Chlorine free, EcoLogo & 
Green Seal Certified, or 
equal quality/size product 

232 

Greenwood Nittany MFN4000 Brown 1 9.5” x 9.25” 100 250 16 4000 17 16.93 232 $12.50 $2,900.00 $0.0462 
Great Western Supply Bedford MF102 Brown 1 9.5” x 9.25” 60 250 16 4000 18 16.72 232 $12.45 $2,888.40 $0.0465 
Midland Paper NPS ReTain 21580 Brown 1 9.4” x 9.25” 40 250 16 4000 18 16.38 595 $13.35 $3,097.20 $0.0509 
Midland Paper Right Choice 78000012 Brown 1 9” x 9.45”  250 16 4000  15.61 595 $13.55 $3,143.60 $0.0543 
JP Gasway Nova MK250 Brown  9.45” x 9” 100 250 16 4000 17 15.82 232 $14.66 $3,401.12 $0.0579 

BL Murray Vondrehle 548-K Kraft  9.25” x 9.5”  250 16 4000 18 16.81 232 $16.82 $3,902.24 $0.0625 

White Distribution and 
Supply 

Universal TRKMK530A Brown 1 9.5” x 9.13” 40 250 16 4000 20 18.48 232 $29.5746 $6,861.3072 $0.1000 

103 

White Multi 
Fold Towel  

MB540A Essity Tork 
Universal 

9.5” x 9.13”, 250/pkg, 16 
pkgs/case, 4,000 
towels/case, 100% recycled 
fiber, Gross Cs. Wt. 19.04 
lbs., Net Cs. Wt. 17.66 lbs., 
Chlorine free, EcoLogo 
Certified, or equal 
quality/size product 

156 

Great Western Supply Bedford MF101 White 1 9.5” x 9.25” 80 250 16 4000 18 17.05 156 $14.42 $2,249.52 $0.0529 
Greenwood Nittany NP5301 White 1 9.25” x 9.5” 100 250 16 4000 17 16.70 156 $14.35 $2,238.60 $0.0537 
Midland Paper Essity Tork MB540A White 1 9.125” x 9.5”  250 16 4000 19 17.69 156 $15.95 $2,488.20 $0.0564 
BL Murray Vondrehle 548-W White  9.25” x 9.5”  250 16 4000 19 17.55 156 $19.41 $3,027.96 $0.0691 

JP Gasway Nova MB200 White  9.45” x 9” 100 250 16 4000 17 16.53 156 $18.37 $2,865.72 $0.0695 

White Distribution and 
Supply 

Universal TRKMB540A White 1 9.13” x 9.5” 20 250 16 4000 20 17.30 156 $24.2464 $3,782.4384 $0.0876 
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Paper Towels 

Item 
# Description No. of 

Cases Vendor Manufacturer & 
Brand 

Stock 
Number Color Ply 

Sheet Size 
Roll 

Size, Core Size 
(W X L) 

Post-Consumer 
Content % 

Items 
Per 
Pkg 

Pkgs 
Per 

Case 
Items/ 
Ft. Per 
Case 

Bid 
Case 
Wt. 

Net Cs Wt in 
lbs. 

Determined 
from 

Provided 
Sample 

Number 
of 

Cases 
Case 
Price Total Price 

Price Per 
Ounce of 

Paper 

104 

Premium 
White Multi 
Fold Towel  

420570 Essity Tork 
Premium 

9.5” x 9”, 1 ply, 250/pkg, 12 
pkgs/case, 3,000/ 
towels/case, 100% recycled, 
40% PCW, EPA Compliant, 
EcoLogo & Green Seal 
Certified, Gross Case Wt. 
14.2 lbs.  
(Replaced Wausau Artisan 
04220) 

714 

Greenwood Empress 40011 White 1 9” x 9.45” 100 250 16 4000 14 11.98 535 $17.34 $9,276.90 $0.0905 
White Distribution and 
Supply 

Universal TRK420483 Natural/
White 

1 9.13” x 9.5” 50 250 16 4000 19 17.46 714 $25.7404 $18,378.645 $0.0921 

Midland Paper Essity Tork Premium 420580 
(replaces 
obsolete 
520570) 

White 1 9.5” x 9” 40 250 12 3000 13.94 12.83 714 $19.18 $13,694.52 $0.0934 

JP Gasway Empress HT400011 White  9.45” x 9.06”  250 16 4000 20.3 12.40 536 $19.01 $10,189.36 $0.0958 
Capital Sanitary Supply Essity Tork Premium TORK420580 White 1 9.5” x 9” 40 250 12 3000 12.8 13.03 714 $21.00 $14,994.00 $0.1007 
Great Western Supply Essity 101293 White 2 9.125” x 9.5” 50 189 16 3024 16.3 15.52 708.33 $26.07 $18,466.16 $0.1050 

Greenwood Nittany NP5305 White 1 9.25” x 9.5” 100 150 16 2400 14 8.32 714 $18.80 $13,423.20 $0.1412 

105 

Brown Hand 
Towel Roll  

RK350A Essity Tork 
Universal 

7.88” x 350’, 1.9” core size, 
Roll Diameter 5.5”, 12 
rolls/case, 4,200’/case, 
100% recycled fibers/40% 
Post Consumer Fiber, Net 
Cs. Wt. 20.2 lbs., Chlorine 
free, EcoLogo & Green Seal 
Certified, EPA Compliant, or 
equal quality/size product 

5 

BL Murray Vondrehle 835-N Brown  W: 7.9”, D: 6”, 
Core: 2” 

 350’ 12 4200’ 19 18.41 5 $17.17 $85.85 $0.0583 

Great Western Supply Essity RK350A Brown 1 7.875” x 350’, 
Core: 1.8” 

40 350’ 12 4200’ 20.21 21.03 5 $21.39 $106.95 $0.0636 

Midland Paper Essity Tork RK350A Natural 1 7.875” x 350’ 40 350’ 12 4200’ 22 20.91 5 $22.60 $113.00 $0.0676 

JP Gasway Nova 350N Brown  8” x 350’ 40 350’ 12 4200’ 17.39 15.49 5 $16.85 $84.25 $0.0680 

106 

Brown Hand 
Towel Roll  

RK600E Essity Tork 
Universal 

7.9” x 600’, 1.9” core, 6.7” 
roll dia., 12 rolls/case,  
7,200’/case, 100% recycled 
fiber/40% Post consumer 
fiber, Net Cs. Wt. 37.8 lbs., 
Chlorine free, EcoLogo 
Certified, EPA Compliant, or 
equal quality/size product 

31 

Greenwood Nittany NP-12600 
ENPG 

Brown 1 8” x 600’ 100 600’ 12 7200’ 30 31.49 31 $25.35 $785.85 $0.0503 

Great Western Supply Essity RK600E Brown 1 7.875” x 600’, 
Core: 1.8” 

40 600’ 12 7200’ 37.8 36.15 31 $29.60 $917.60 $0.0512 

Midland Paper Essity Tork RK600E Natural 1 7.875” x 600’  600’ 12 7200’ 39.6 36.62 31 $30.93 $958.83 $0.0528 

BL Murray Vondrehle 860-N Brown  W: 7.9”, D: 7”, 
Core: 2” 

 600’ 12 7200’ 34 32.94 31 $27.99 $867.69 $0.0531 

Midland Paper Morcon Inc. R12600 Natural 1 7.9” x 600’  600’ 12 7200’  29.79 31 $27.75 $860.25 $0.0582 
JP Gasway Nova 600N Brown  8” x 600’ 40 600’ 12 7200’ 27.2 27.30 31 $26.39 $818.09 $0.0604 
Midland Paper NPS Retain 30610 Natural 1 8” x 600’  600’ 12 7200’ 32.2 28.23 31 $29.58 $916.98 $0.0655 

107 

Brown Hand 
Towel  
Roll  

RK800E Essity Tork 
Universal 

7.9” x 800’, 1.9” core, 6 
rolls/case, 7.8” roll diameter, 
4,800 L. Ft./case, Net Cs. 
Wt. 25.2 lbs., 100% 
recycled fiber, 40% post-
consumer fiber, EcoLogo & 
Green Seal Certified, EPA 
Compliant,  or equal 
quality/size product 

17 

Greenwood Nittany NP-6800 EN Brown 1 7.9” x 800’ 100 800’ 6 4800’ 22 21.76 17 $15.47 $262.99 $0.0444 
Great Western Supply Bedford HWRT800K Brown 1 7.85” x 800’ 40 800’ 6 4800’ 23.7 22.73 17 $16.15 $274.55 $0.0444 

Midland Paper NPS Retain 30700 Natural 1 8” x 800’ 40 800’ 6 4800’ 22.04 21.69 17 $16.92 $287.64 $0.0488 

Midland Paper Essity Tork Universal RK800E Natural 1 7.875” x 800’ 40 800’ 6 4800’ 25.2 23.26 17 $19.65 $334.05 $0.0528 
BL Murray Vondrehle 880-N Brown  W: 7.9”, D: 7.5”, 

Core: 2” 
 800’ 6 4800’ 22 21.23 17 

$18.47 $313.99 $0.0544 
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Paper Towels 

Item 
# Description No. of 

Cases Vendor Manufacturer & 
Brand 

Stock 
Number Color Ply 

Sheet Size 
Roll 

Size, Core Size 
(W X L) 

Post-Consumer 
Content % 

Items 
Per 
Pkg 

Pkgs 
Per 

Case 
Items/ 
Ft. Per 
Case 

Bid 
Case 
Wt. 

Net Cs Wt in 
lbs. 

Determined 
from 

Provided 
Sample 

Number 
of 

Cases 
Case 
Price Total Price 

Price Per 
Ounce of 

Paper 

108 

Brown 
Universal 
Roll Towel 

46000 Wausau 
Artisan 
Ecosoft 

8” x 425’, 1.9” core, 12 
rolls/case, 5,100’/case, 
Gross Cs. Wt. 29 lbs., 100% 
recycled/ 40% Post-
Consumer Waste, EPA 
compliant (not certified), or 
equal quality/size product 

36 

Greenwood Nittany NP-12425 FW Brown 1 8” x 425’ 100 425’ 12 5100’ 25 22.90 36 $17.96 $646.56 $0.0490 

Midland Paper NPS ReTain 30310 Natural 1 8” x 350’ 40 350’ 12 4200’ 20 20.45 36 DNMS 

109 

White Center 
Pull Roll 
Towel 

28124 Georgia 
Pacific 
SofPull 

7.8” x 15”, 2.375” core, 324 
sheets/roll, 1,920 
sheets/case, 6 rolls/case. 
Net Cs. Wt. 10.920 lbs.,  NO 
SUBSTITUTIONS 

46 

Capital Sanitary Supply Georgia Pacific 28124 White 1 7.875” x 15”, 
Core: 2.375” 

 324 
sheets 

6 2400’, 
1944 

sheets 

11.87 10.93 46 $32.22 $1,482.12 $0.1842 

Midland Paper Georgia-Pacific 
SofPull 

28124 White 1 7.875” x 15’  320’ 6 1920 11.87 11.17 46 $32.95 $1,515.70 $0.1844 

Great Western Supply Essity 120932 White 2 7.6” x 11.8”, 
7.6” x 491’, 

Core: 3” 

40 491’, 
500 

sheets 

6 2946’ 17 16.23 38 DNMS 

JP Gasway Nova 22910 White 2 7.5” x 9”  1 roll 6 32400’, 
3600 

sheets 

13.83 12.40 43 DNMS 

BL Murray Vondrehle CP320 White  W: 7.6”, L: 15”, 
D: 6.1” 

 320 12 3840 22  23 DNMS 

110 

White 
Centerfeed 
Hand Towel 

RC530 Essity Tork 
Universal 

7.6” x 11.8”, 2 ply, 530 
sheets/roll, 518.96’/case, 6 
rolls/case, 2.9” core, 100% 
recycled fiber/40% Post 
Consumer Fiber, EcoLogo 
Certified, EPA Compliant, 
Net Case Wt. 16 lbs. 
(Replaced Bay West 
EcoSoft 60029) 

0 

                

111 

White Center 
Pull Hand 
Towel 

45784 Solaris- 
Livi Basic 

White, 2 ply, 7” x 10.4” 
550’/roll, 6 rolls/case, 
3,300’/case, Net Cs. Wt. 
15.72 lbs. 0 
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Paper Towels 

Item 
# Description No. of 

Cases Vendor Manufacturer & 
Brand 

Stock 
Number Color Ply 

Sheet Size 
Roll 

Size, Core Size 
(W X L) 

Post-Consumer 
Content % 

Items 
Per 
Pkg 

Pkgs 
Per 

Case 
Items/ 
Ft. Per 
Case 

Bid 
Case 
Wt. 

Net Cs Wt in 
lbs. 

Determined 
from 

Provided 
Sample 

Number 
of 

Cases 
Case 
Price Total Price 

Price Per 
Ounce of 

Paper 

112 

Brown 
Perforated 
Roll Towel 

HK1975A Essity Tork 
Universal 

2 ply, perforated, 11” x 9”, 2 
ply, 210 towels/roll, 157.5’ 
per roll, 5.5” roll diameter, 
12 rolls/case, 2,520 
towels/case, 100% recycled, 
Net Wt.  16.21lbs., 100% 
recycled, 85% post-
consumer waste, EPA 
compliant for post-consumer 
waste, Chlorine free, 
EcoLogo & Green Seal 
certified, or equal 
quality/size product 

104 

Midland Paper Essity Tork HK1975A Brown 2 11” x 9” 85 210 12 1890’, 
2520 

sheets 

16.1 16.72 104 $18.26 $1,899.04 $0.0683 

Great Western Supply Essity HK1975A Brown 2 11” x 9” 85 210 
sheets 

12 1890’, 
2520 

sheets 

16.2 16.71 104 $18.81 $1,956.24 $0.0704 

Capital Sanitary Supply Essity Tork HK1975A Brown 2 11” x 9” 85 210 
sheets 

12 1890’, 
2520 

sheets 

18.3 17.12 104 $19.64 $2,042.56 $0.0717 

JP Gasway Empress E21251 Brown 2 8 ½” x 11” 100 250 12 3000 
sheets 

15.7 15.87 88 $25.53 $2,246.64 $0.1005 

113 

White 
Perforated 
Roll Towel 

HB1995A Essity Tork Perforated, 11” x 9”, 2 ply, 
210 towels/roll, , 157.5’ per 
roll, 5.5” roll diameter, 12 
rolls/case, 2,520 
towels/case , Net Cs. Wt. 
14.9 lbs., Chlorine free, 
EcoLogo Certified, 100% 
recycled fibers, or equal 
quality/size product 

42 

Great Western Supply Essity HB1995A White 2 11” x 9” 20 210 
sheets 

12 1890’, 
2520 

sheets 

14.9 15.69 42 $19.97 $838.74 $0.0796 

Capital Sanitary Supply Essity Tork HB1995A White 2 11” x 9” 20 210 
sheets 

12 1890’, 
2520 

sheets 

17 16.14 42 $20.85 $875.70 $0.0807 

Midland Paper Essity Tork HB1995A White 2 11” x 9” 20 210 12 1890’, 
2520 

sheets 

14.8 14.74 42 $19.30 $810.60 $0.0818 

JP Gasway Empress KT23085 White 2 8 ½” x 11” 100 85 30 2550 
sheets 

14.6 13.99 42 $21.66 $909.72 $0.0968 

114 

White Roll 
Towel 

290095 Essity Tork 
Advanced  
Soft Matic  

White, black plastic core 
plug,  .7.7” roll width, roll 
diameter 7.3”, 900’/roll, 
1,136 sheets/roll, 6 
rolls/case, 5,400 L. Ft./case, 
FSC certified, Net Cs. Wt. 
21.9 lbs., NO 
SUBSTITUTIONS 

0 

                

115 

White Soft 
Center Pull 
Hand Towel 

120932 Essity Tork 
Advanced 

White, 2-ply, 7.6” x 492.5’, 
core diameter 2.9”, Roll 
width 7.6”, Sheet length 
11.8”, 500 sheets/roll, 100% 
recycled fiber/40% post 
consumer fiber, EcoLogo 
Certified, EPA Compliant, 
Net Cs. Wt. 15.2 lbs., or 
equal quality/size product 

0 
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Wipers 
Ite
m # Description No. of 

Cases Vendor Manufacturer & 
Brand 

Stock 
Number Color Ply 

Sheet Size Roll 
Size, Core Size 

(W X L) 
Post-

Consumer 
Content % 

Items 
Per 
Pkg 

Pkgs 
Per 

Case 
Items/ 
Ft. Per 
Case 

Case Wt. 
Number 

Of 
Cases 

Case 
Price Total Price 

201 

Light Duty 
Single Ply 
1/4 Fold 

L30 05812 Kimberly 
Clark  
WypAll 

White, 12.5” x 13”, 90 
sheets/pkg., 12 pkgs./case, 
1,080 sheets/case,  
5pprox.. cs. Wt. 14 lbs., or 
equal quality/size product 

15 

Midland Paper Kimberly-Clark 
WypAll* L30 Wipers 

5812 White  12.5” x 12”  90 12 1080 14 15 $38.59 $578.85 

202 

Single Duty 
Scrim Pop-
Up Box 
required 

 
N-
E025IDW 

Hospeco White, 4-ply, 9.75” x 16.75”, 
interfold, 150 sheets/pop-up 
box, 6 boxes/case,  
900 sheets/case, approx.. 
cs. Wt. 17 lbs., or equal 

29 

Greenwood Sellars 15200 White 4 9.5” x 16.5” 40 175 8 1400  18 $56.75 $1,021.50 

*Great Western 
Supply 

Berk DRC-3400P White 1 9” x 16”  100 
wipers 

9 900 
wipers 

17 29 DNMS 

Midland Paper Boardwalk BWKE025ID
W 

10048772 

White 4 9.75” x 16.75” 40 100 9 900 17.17 29 $48.96 $1,419.84 

203 

Industrial 
Blue Paper 
Wiper Pop-
Up Box 
required 

440245A  
Essity Tork 
Industrial 
Wiper 

Blue, 4-ply, 8.54” x 16.5”, 
100% recycled, 90 
sheets/pkg., 10 pkgs./case, 
900 sheets/case, 5pprox.. 
cs. Wt. 16.04 lbs., or equal 

25 

Midland Paper Essity Tork 440245A Blue 4 8.54” x 16.5” 40 90 10 900 16 25 $35.80 $895.00 

Great Western Supply Essity 440245A Blue 4 8.54” x 16.5” 0 90 10 900 16 25 $37.85 $946.25 

204 

Medium Duty 
Bracket 
Wiper  
Flat Pack 
Box 

BDRC30 Timmerman  Tan, 2-ply, 12” x 14”, 2,250 
sheets/pkg., 1 pkg./case, 
40% post-consumer 
content,  
5pprox.. cs. Wt. 34 lbs., or 
equal 

56 

Greenwood Timmerman BDRC30 Tan 1 12” x 15” 40 1620 1 1275 20.4 56 $46.00 $2,576.00 

205 

Heavy Duty 
Single Ply 
1/4 Fold 

192136 Essity Tork  White, 1-ply, 12.5” x 13”, 56 
sheets/pkg., 16 pkgs./case, 
896 sheets/case, 80% 
recycled content, 20% post-
consumer waste content, 
5pprox.. cs. Wt. 17.94 lbs., 
or equal 

27 

Great Western Supply Essity 192136 White 1 12.5” x 3” 0 56 16 896 
wipers 

17.9 27 $26.74 $721.98 

Midland Paper Kimberly-Clark 
Wypall* X60 

34865 White 1 12.5” x 12”  76 12 912 15 27 $45.85 $1,237.95 

Midland Paper Essity Tork 192136 White 1 12.5” x 13” 20 56 16 896 17.9 27 NO SAMPLE 

 

 

Bathroom Tissue 
Item 

# Description No. of 
Cases Vendor Manufacturer & Brand Stock 

Number Color Pl
y 

Sheet Size 
Roll 

Size, Core Size 
(W X L) 

Post-
Consumer 
Content % 

Items 
Per 
Pkg 

Pkgs 
Per 

Case 
Items/ 
Ft. Per 
Case 

Bid 
Case 
Wt. 

Net Cs Wt in lbs. 
Determined 

from Provided 
Sample 

Number 
Of 

Cases 
Case 
Price Total Price Price Per 

Ounce 

301 
2 Ply 

Standard 
Roll 

TM1616 Essity Tork 
Universal 

White, 4.38” x 3.75”, 500 
sheets/roll, 96 rolls/case, 
48,000 sheets/case, 
156.25’/roll, 15,000’/case, Net 
Cs. Wt. 32.08 lbs., 100% 
recycled fiber, 20% post-
consumer fiber, Chlorine free, 
safe for septic, EcoLogo 
Certified, or equal quality/size 
product 

30 

Midland Paper NPS ReSponse 12375 White 2 4.5” x 3.75” 40 500 96 48000 34 36.18 30 $33.45 $1,003.50 $0.0578 

Great Western Supply Bedford SBT502 White 2 4.5” x 3.5” 65 500 
sheets 

96 14000’, 48000 
sheets 

32 32.28 30 $30.63 $918.90 $0.0593 
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Bathroom Tissue 
Item 

# Description No. of 
Cases Vendor Manufacturer & Brand Stock 

Number Color Pl
y 

Sheet Size 
Roll 

Size, Core Size 
(W X L) 

Post-
Consumer 
Content % 

Items 
Per 
Pkg 

Pkgs 
Per 

Case 
Items/ 
Ft. Per 
Case 

Bid 
Case 
Wt. 

Net Cs Wt in lbs. 
Determined 

from Provided 
Sample 

Number 
Of 

Cases 
Case 
Price Total Price Price Per 

Ounce 

302 
2 Ply 

Standard 
Roll 

TM1616S Essity Tork 
Universal 

White, 3.96” x 3.75”, 500 
sheets/roll, 96 rolls/case, 
48,000 sheets/case, 
156.25’/roll, 15,000’/case, Net 
Cs. Wt. 29.05 lbs., 100% 
recycled fiber, 20% post-
consumer fiber, Chlorine free, 
safe for septic, EcoLogo 
Certified and EPA compliant, or 
equal 

578 

Great Western Supply Bedford SBT500 White 2 4.1” x 3.75” 65 500 
sheets 

96 150000’, 
48000 sheets 

31 30.66 578 $28.34 $16,380.52 $0.0578 

Midland Paper Essity Tork TM1616S White 2 4.1” x 3.75” 20 500 96 48000 33 29.82 578 $28.96 $16,738.88 $0.0607 

White Distribution and 
Supply 

Universal TRKM1616
S 

White 2 4” x 3.75” 20 500 96  34 30.78 578 $46.0608 $26,623.14
2 

$0.0935 

JP Gasway Nova 4535 White 2 4.5” x 3.5” 20 500 
sheets 

96 14000’ 35.5 31.56 578 DNMS 

BL Murray Vondrehle 5022 White 2 4.5” x 3.6”, 
Core: 1.625” 

 500 96 48000 35  578 
DNMS 

303 
2 Ply 

Standard 
Roll 

965002 Empress 

White, 4.06” x 3.6”, 500 
sheets/roll, 96 rolls/case, 
48,000 sheets/case, 
14,400’/case, 100% virgin 
paper, Chlorine free, safe for 
septic, NO SUBSTITUTIONS 

22 

             

NO BID 

304 
2 Ply 

Executive 
Standard 

Size 
19029 

Georgia 
Pacific 

“Never-Out” 

Facial quality, white, 3.9/10" x 
4", 770 sheets/roll, 36,960 
sheets/case, 48 rolls/case, Net 
Wt. 24.26 lbs., EPA Compliant, 
FSC certified, 25% recycled 
fiber content, or equal 

0 

                

305 2 Ply Roll TM1604 Essity Tork 
Universal 

White, 3.9" x 3.75”, 1.9” core, 
750 sheets/roll, 48 rolls/case, 
36,000 sheets/case, 234.4’/roll, 
11,250’/case, Net Wt. 21.3 lbs., 
100% recycled fiber, 25% post 
consumer fibers, EcoLogo & 
Green Seal Certified, EPA 
compliant, or equal quality/size 
product 

202 

Midland Paper Essity Tork TM1604 White 2 3.9” x 3.75” 25 750 48 11250’, 36000 
sheets 

23.9 22.71 202 $29.28 $5,914.56 $0.0806 

Capital Sanitary 
Supply 

Essity Tork TM1604 White 2 3.9” x 3.75” 25 750 
sheets 

48 11250’, 36000 
sheets 

23.9 22.59 202 $35.03 $7,076.06 $0.0969 

BL Murray Vondrehle RR600 White 2 3 7/8” x 4”, 
Core: 1.875” 

 616 48 29568 22 21.15 202 $36.34 $7,340.68 $0.1074 

Great Western Supply Essity 240616 
(Tork 

Replaceme
nt for 

discontinue
d item) 

White 2 4” x 3.75” 20 616 
sheets 

48 9854.4’, 
29568 sheets 

18.5 18.72 246 $33.88 $8,334.48 $0.1131 

306 
2 Ply 

Interfolde
d Sheets 

10101 
Georgia 
Pacific 

Preference 

4" x 5" sheet, 400 sheets/pkg., 
60 pkgs./case, 24,000 
sheets/case, Gross Cs. Wt. 
21.2 lbs., Net Cs. Wt. 20.4 lbs., 
or equal quality/size product 

0 
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Bathroom Tissue 
Item 

# Description No. of 
Cases Vendor Manufacturer & Brand Stock 

Number Color Pl
y 

Sheet Size 
Roll 

Size, Core Size 
(W X L) 

Post-
Consumer 
Content % 

Items 
Per 
Pkg 

Pkgs 
Per 

Case 
Items/ 
Ft. Per 
Case 

Bid 
Case 
Wt. 

Net Cs Wt in lbs. 
Determined 

from Provided 
Sample 

Number 
Of 

Cases 
Case 
Price Total Price Price Per 

Ounce 

307 
2 Ply, 9 

inch, 
Jumbo 
Jr. Roll 

13728 
Georgia 
Pacific 

Acclaim 
Rollsaver 

White, 3.5" x 1000', 3.3" core, 8 
rolls/case, 8,000'/case, Net Cs. 
Wt. 14.52 lbs., or equal 
quality/size product 

195 

Greenwood Nittany NP-5216 White 2 3.3” x 1000’ 100 1000’ 12 12000’ 19.31 20.40 195 $18.50 $3,607.50 $0.0567 

Great Western Supply Bedford JRT404 White 2 3.31” x 1000’ 65 1000’ 12 12000’ 20 19.40 195 $17.71 $3,453.45 $0.0571 

Midland Paper NPS ReSponse 19920 White 2 3.3” x 1000’ 40 1000’ 12 12000 21.07 19.59 195 $18.90 $3,685.50 $0.0603 

JP Gasway Nova 1002 White 2 3.5” x 1000’ 100 1000’ 12 12000’ 22 19.01 130 $20.76 $2,698.80 $0.0683 
White Distribution and 
Supply 

NPS Corp 8000263 White 2 3.3” x 1000’, 
Core: 3.3” 

  12  21.07 20.44 210 
minimum 
order qty 
– price 
remains 
the same 

$23.7561 $4,632.439
5 

$0.0726 

BL Murray Vondrehle 1208-8 White 2 3.54” x 9”, 
Core: 3.3” 

 1000 8 8000 15 14.68 195 $19.53 $3,808.35 $0.0832 

308 
2 Ply, 

9" Jumbo 
Roll 

4097 
Cascades 

North River 
Universal 

3.5” x 1,000’, 12 rolls/case, 
12,000 ft./case , Cs. Wt. 22 
lbs., 100% recycled fibers, 60% 
post-consumer fibers, EPA 
Compliant, EcoLogo & Green 
Seal Certified, or equal 
quality/size product 

0 

                

309 
Mini 

Jumbo 
7.4” Roll 

1202440
2 

Essity Tork 
Advanced 

Mini Jumbo 
Roll 

2-ply, 3.48" x 751', 7.36" roll 
diameter, 2.34” core diameter, 
12 rolls/case, 9,012’/case, Net 
Cs. Wt. 15.33 lbs., 100% 
recycled fibers w/ minimum 
25% post-consumer fiber, 
Chlorine free, EcoLogo 
Certified and EPA Compliant, 
or equal 

25 

BL Murray Vondrehle 2750 White 2 3.54” x 7.5”, 
Core: 2.3” 

 750 12 9000 17 16.25 25 $21.41 $535.25 $0.0824 

Great Western Supply Essity 12024402 White 2 3.55” x 751’ 20 751’ 12 9012’ 17.4 16.21 25 $31.78 $794.50 $0.1225 
Midland Paper Right Choice 78000017 White 2   700’ 12 8400   25 NO SAMPLE 
Midland Paper NPS Merfin 212 White 2 93.5 x 750’ 80 750’ 12 9000 17.86  25 NO SAMPLE 

310 
2 Ply 

Compact 
Coreless 

19375 
Georgia 
Pacific 
COMPACT® 
Coreless 

3.85” x 4.05", 1,000 sheets, 36 
rolls/case, Net Cs. Wt. 23.78 
lbs., 25% PCW, EcoLogo & 
Green Seal certified to GS-1 
standard, & EPA Compliant, or 
equal quality/size product 
(Compact® allows you to 
convert existing dispensers 
with the use of specially 
designed dispenser spindles.) 

40 

Midland Paper Georgia-Pacific Compact 19375 White 2 3.85” x 4.05” 20 1000 36 12150’, 36000 
sheets 

23.89 24.84 40 $40.95 $1,638.00 $0.1030 

Great Western Supply Solaris 26821 White 2 3.85” x 4.05”  1000 
sheets 

36 36000 sheets 21.45 21.62 40 $39.17 $1,566.80 $0.1132 

Greenwood Nittany NP-
3610002 

White 2 3.75” x 3.75” 0 1000 36 11250’, 36000 
sheets 

25 19.44 40 $41.50 $1,660.00 $0.1334 

311 
2 Ply 

Coreless 
Compact 

Von-
PR350 VonDrehle 

350’/roll, 24 rolls/case, 
8,400’/case, Net Cs. Wt. 18 
lbs., 20% PCW-meets EPA 
guidelines for post-consumer 
waste content, or equal 
quality/size product 

55 

BL Murray Vondrehle PR350 White 2 3.875” x 5.1”, 
Core: 0.882” 

 350 24 8400 10 16.56 55 $26.70 $1,468.50 $0.1008 

Midland Paper Morcon MORM100
0 

White 2 3.9” x 4” 25 1000 36 12000’, 36000 
sheets 

21 17.82 52 $32.03 $1,665.56 $0.1123 
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Bathroom Tissue 
Item 

# Description No. of 
Cases Vendor Manufacturer & Brand Stock 

Number Color Pl
y 

Sheet Size 
Roll 

Size, Core Size 
(W X L) 

Post-
Consumer 
Content % 

Items 
Per 
Pkg 

Pkgs 
Per 

Case 
Items/ 
Ft. Per 
Case 

Bid 
Case 
Wt. 

Net Cs Wt in lbs. 
Determined 

from Provided 
Sample 

Number 
Of 

Cases 
Case 
Price Total Price Price Per 

Ounce 

312 2 Ply Roll 
Coreless 19378 

Georgia 
Pacific 
COMPACT® 
Coreless 
 

3.85’ x 4.05”, 5.75” roll 
diameter, 1,500 sheets/roll, 18 
rolls/case,  
27,000 sheets/case, 100% 
recycled fiber, 25% PCW, 
EcoLogo & Green Seal 
Certified to GS-1 standard, & 
EPA Compliant, or equal 
quality/size product (Compact® 
allows you to convert existing 
dispensers with the use of 
specially designed dispenser 
spindles.) 
 

0 

                

313 
2 Ply, 
High 

Capacity 
110292A 

Essity Tork 
Advanced 

T26 System 

3.94" x 3.75", core 1.7”,  5.4” 
roll diameter, 1,000 sheets/roll, 
36 rolls/case, 312.5’/roll, Cs. 
Wt. 21.7 lbs., 100% recycled 
fiber, 20% post-consumer 
fibers, EcoLogo Certified and 
EPA compliant 

9 

Midland Paper Essity Tork 110292A White 2 3.94” x 3.75” 20 1000 
sheet

s 

36 11250’, 
36000 
sheets 

25.1 22.46 9 $42.96 $386.64 $0.1196 

Great Western Supply Essity 110292A White 2 3.94” x 3.75” 20 1000 
sheet

s 

36 36000 
sheets 

25.1 22.50 9 $44.35 $399.15 $0.1232 

 

Facial Tissue 
Item 

# Description No. of 
Cases Vendor Manufacturer & 

Brand 
Stock 

Number Color Ply 
Sheet Size Roll 
Size, Core Size 

(W X L) 
Post-

Consumer 
Content % 

Items 
Per 
Pkg 

Pkgs 
Per 

Case 
Items/ 
Ft. Per 
Case 

Case 
Wt. 

Number 
Of 

Cases 
Case 
Price Total Price Price Per 

Ounce 

401 2 Ply TF6710A Essity Tork 
Universal  

Flat box, white, 2-ply, 8.2" x 7.88", 
100 tissues/box, 30 boxes/case, 
3,000 tissues/case, 100% 
recycled, Chlorine free, or equal 
quality/size product 

56 

Midland Paper Essity Tork Advanced TF6810 White 1 8.2” x 7.88”  100 30 3000 11.47 56 $15.60 $873.60 $0.0850 

Great Western Supply Nova Nova2 White 2 7.75” x 8.25” 0 100 30 3000 9.7 56 $15.17 $849.52 $0.0978 

   

Napkins 

Item 
# Description No. of 

Cases Vendor Manufacturer & 
Brand 

Stock 
Number Color Ply 

Sheet Size 
Roll 

Size, Core 
Size 

(W X L) 

Post-
Consumer 
Content % 

Items 
Per 
Pkg 

Pkgs 
Per 

Case 
Items/ 
Ft. Per 
Case 

Case Wt. 
Number 

Of 
Cases 

Case 
Price Total Price 

501 

Luncheon, 
1/4 Fold 

L3141 

Essity Tork 
Universal 

1/4 fold, white, 1-ply, 11.5" x 
12.88" unfolded, 5.75” x 6.5” 
folded, 500 napkins/pkg.,  
12 pkgs./case, 6,000 
napkins/case, 100% recycled, 
Chlorine free, EcoLogo 
Certified, or equal quality/size 
product 

1 

Midland Paper Morcon L12500 
10032906 

White 2 11” x 13”  500 12 6000 12 1 $33.88 $33.88 

Great Western Supply Essity L3141 White 1 13” x 11.5” 20 500 12 6000 16 1 NO SAMPLE 
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Napkins 

Item 
# Description No. of 

Cases Vendor Manufacturer & 
Brand 

Stock 
Number Color Ply 

Sheet Size 
Roll 

Size, Core 
Size 

(W X L) 

Post-
Consumer 
Content % 

Items 
Per 
Pkg 

Pkgs 
Per 

Case 
Items/ 
Ft. Per 
Case 

Case Wt. 
Number 

Of 
Cases 

Case 
Price Total Price 

502 

Dinner, 1/8 
Fold 

NP310A 

Essity Tork 
Advanced 

1/8 fold, white, 2-ply, 15" x 
16.25" unfolded, 3.75" x 8.13" 
folded, 375 napkins/pkg., 8 
pkgs./case, 3,000 
napkins/case, 100% recycled, 
Chlorine free, or equal 
quality/size product 

1 

Midland Paper Morcon 3466 White 2 14.5” x 16.5”  150 20 3000 27 1 DNMS 

Midland Paper Essity Tork 
Advanced 

NP310A White 2 16.5” x 15”  375 8 3000 35.43 1 $35.06 $35.06 

Great Western Supply Essity NP310A White 2 15” x 16.25” 20 375 8 3000 35.6 1 NO SAMPLE 

503 

Dispenser 
Napkin 
Natural 

DX900 

Essity Tork 
Universal 

Xpressnap 
Interfold, 

Natural, 1-ply, 13" x 8.5" 
unfolded, 6.5” x 4.25” folded, 
500 napkins/pkg.,  
12 pkgs./case, 6,000 
napkins/case, 100% recycled, 
Chlorine free, EcoLogo 
Certified,  
EPA compliant for minimum 
40% post-consumer waste, 
or equal quality/size product 

3 

Midland Paper Essity Tork DX900 
110640 

White 1 13” x 8.5” 20 500 12 6000 19.7 3 
$43.86 $131.58 

Great Western Supply Essity DX900 White 1 13” x 8.5” 20 500 12 6000 19.7 3 $44.21 $132.63 

504 

Dispenser 
Napkin 

D3061 
Essity Tork 
Universal 
Daintifold 
Lowfold, 

White, 1-ply, 8.7" x 12" 
unfolded, 3.5" x 5" folded, 334 
napkins/pkg., 24 pkgs./case, 
8,016 napkins/case, Chlorine 
free, 100% recycled content, 
EcoLogo Certified, or equal 
quality/size product 

0 

              

   

Gloves 
Item 

# Description 
Number 

Of 
Cases 

Vendor 
 

Manufacturer & 
Brand 

Stock Number Product Description Items Per 
Pkg 

Pkgs 
Per 

Case 

Items 
Per 

Case 

Number 
Of 

Cases 
Case 
Price Total Price 

601 Poly. Food 
Service 

Polyethylene Food Service Glove, clear, 1.25 mil 
thickness, 11.5" long, 100 gloves/box, 1,000 
gloves/case 

10 
        NO BID 

602 
Latex 

Medical 
Exam 

Safety Zone Powder-Free Latex Medical Grade Exam 
Glove, 100 gloves/box, 1,000 gloves/case, Small, 1) 
Meets FDA 510K Standards for examination gloves used 
in medical applications. 2) These medical grade 
examination gloves also meet the Federal Food, Drug 
and Cosmetic Act which allows repeated use in direct 
contact with food. 

8 

** Great Western Supply Safeko 6100 Synthetic vinyl, powder free, small 100 10 1000 8 $98.85 $790.80 
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Gloves 
Item 

# Description 
Number 

Of 
Cases 

Vendor 
 

Manufacturer & 
Brand 

Stock Number Product Description Items Per 
Pkg 

Pkgs 
Per 

Case 

Items 
Per 

Case 

Number 
Of 

Cases 
Case 
Price Total Price 

603 
Latex 

Medical 
Exam 

Safety Zone Powder-Free Latex Medical Grade Exam 
Glove,100 gloves/box, 1,000 gloves/case, Medium, 1) 
Meets FDA 510K Standards for examination gloves used 
in medical applications. 2) These medical grade 
examination gloves also meet the Federal Food, Drug 
and Cosmetic Act which allows repeated use in direct 
contact with food. 

15 

** Great Western Supply Safeko 6101 Synthetic vinyl, powder free, medium 100 10 1000 15 $98.85 $1,482.75 

604 
Latex 

Medical 
Exam 

Safety Zone Powder-Free Latex Medical Exam 
Glove,100 gloves/box, 1,000 gloves/case, Large,  
1) Meets FDA 510K Standards for examination gloves 
used in medical applications. 2) These medical grade 
examination gloves also meet the Federal Food, Drug 
and Cosmetic Act which allows repeated use in direct 
contact with food. 

89 

** Great Western Supply Safeko 6102 Synthetic vinyl, powder free, large 100 10 1000 89 $98.85 $8,797.65 

605 
Latex 

Medical 
Exam 

Safety Zone Powder-Free Latex Medical Exam 
Glove,100 gloves/box, 1,000 gloves/case, X-Large, 1) 
Meets FDA 510K Standards for examination gloves used 
in medical applications. 2) These medical grade 
examination gloves also meet the Federal Food, Drug 
and Cosmetic Act which allows repeated use in direct 
contact with food. 

57 

** Great Western Supply Safeko 6103 Synthetic vinyl, powder free, X-large 100 10 1000 57 $98.85 $5,634.45 

606 Vinyl 
Glove 

Disposable glove, rolled cuff, powdered, clear, non-
sterile, 5 mil thick, 100 gloves/box, 10 boxes/case, Small 0           

607 Vinyl 
Glove 

Disposable glove, rolled cuff, powdered, clear, non-
sterile, 5 mil thick, 100 gloves/box, 10 boxes/case, 
Medium 

0 
          

608 Vinyl 
Glove 

Disposable glove, rolled cuff, powdered, clear, non-
sterile, 5 mil thick, 100 gloves/box, 10 boxes/case, Large 0           

609 Vinyl 
Glove 

Disposable glove, rolled cuff, powdered, clear, non-
sterile, 5 mil thick, 100 gloves/box, 10 boxes/case, Extra 
Large 

0 
          

610 
Nitrile 

Medical 
Exam 

Microflex Supreno Powder Free Nitrile Gloves, 
nonsterile, FOR MEDICAL USE, 4.2 mil thick cuff, 6.1 
mil thick palm, 6.8 mil thick finger, 9.75" long, beaded 
cuff, ambidextrous, film integrity exceeds ASTM 
synthetic glove standard, 100 gloves/pack, NO 
SUBSTITUTIONS, Indicate size needed 

2 

        NO BID 

611 Vinyl 
Glove 

Disposable glove, rolled cuff, non-powdered, clear, non-
sterile, 5 mil thick, 100 gloves/box, 4 boxes/case,  
Medium 

0 
          

612 Vinyl 
Glove 

Disposable glove, rolled cuff, non-powdered, clear, non-
sterile, 5 mil thick, 100 gloves/box, 4 boxes/case, Large 0           

613 Vinyl 
Glove 

Disposable glove, rolled cuff, non-powdered, clear, non-
sterile, 5 mil thick, 100 gloves/box, 4 boxes/case, Extra 
large 

0 
          

614 Nitrile 
Glove 

Touch N Tuff  Nitrile Gloves, non-powdered, 4 mil, 
100 gloves/box, 10boxes/case, Indicate size needed 59 

** Great Western Supply Safeko 610 Synthetic vinyl, powder free 100 10 1000 79 DNMS 
Midland Paper Tradex NXL5201 

10009155 
Disposable glove, blue, 4 mil, powdered, nitrile, 

rolled cuff, smooth surface 
100 10 1000 59 $128.76 $7,596.84 

615 Nitrile 
Glove 

Touch N Tuff  Nitrile Gloves, powdered, 4 mil, 100 
gloves/box, 10boxes/case, Indicate size needed 0           
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Gloves 
Item 

# Description 
Number 

Of 
Cases 

Vendor 
 

Manufacturer & 
Brand 

Stock Number Product Description Items Per 
Pkg 

Pkgs 
Per 

Case 

Items 
Per 

Case 

Number 
Of 

Cases 
Case 
Price Total Price 

616 
Latex 

Medical 
Exam 

Latex, Powder-Free, Medical Exam Glove, FOR 
MEDICAL USE, 6.5 mil thick, S, L, XL, 100 gloves/box, 
10 boxes/case, Indicate size needed 

0 
          

617 Premium 
Nitrile Glove 

Blue, Premium Powdered Nitrile, 5.3 mil thick cuff, 6.0 
mil thick palm, 6.8 mil thick finger, FDA Compliant for 
contact with food, not for medical use, 100 gloves/pkg., 
10 pkgs./case 

33 
Midland Paper Tradex NLG6201 

10042913 
Disposable glove, blue, 6 mil, powder  free, 

premium nitrile xp, rolled cuff, smooth surface 
100 10 1000 33 $89.91 $2,967.03 

  

Miscellaneous Items 
Item 

# Description 
Number 

of 
Cases 

Vendor Manufacturer & 
Brand Stock Number Product Description Items Per 

Pkg 
Pkgs 
Per 

Case 

Items 
Per 

Case 

Number 
Of 

Cases 
Case 
Price Total Price 

701 Sanitary 
Napkins 

Hospital Specialty HOSMT4, #4 Folded Maxi-thin, 
250/case 

0           

702 
Sanitary 
Napkins 

Hospital Specialty  HOSMT8, Flat Maxi pad, #8, flat 
pack, 250/case, or equal quality/size product 40 

Great Western Supply Naturelle 25130973 Maxi Pad #4 1 250 250 40 $41.07 $1,642.80 
Midland Paper Hospital Specialty HOS4147 

LAG462036 
Gards Sanitary Napkins Maxi folded pad, #4, 

vending box* 
1 250 250 40 $45.04 $1,801.60 

703 
Tampons Hospital Specialty HOS T-500, Tampax Tampon, 

500/case, or equal 80 
Midland Paper Proctor & Gamble PGC025001 

LAG462045 
Tampax Tampon 1 500 500 80 $52.48 $4,198.40 

Great Western Supply Proctor & Gamble Tampax Tampons – Cardboard Applicator 1 500 500 80 $53.05 $4,244.00 

704 
Urinal Block 
w/Screen 

ParaFree Urinal Cake Block in a disposable screen 
without blue dye detector, 3 oz., 1500 flushes, non-para 
block deodorants counteract odors, and fight bacteria 
growth, contains no Para dichlorobenzene, 12 
blocks/case 

16 

Midland Paper Hospital Specialty HOS01901 Non-para urinal screen white/pink, cherry 
fragrance 

1 12 12 16 $14.95 $239.20 

Great Western Supply Impact 9400C Urinal Block w/ screen, cherry scent 1 12 12 16 $15.83 $253.28 

705 
Wasp/ 
Hornet Spray 

Aerosol product for the control of hornets, wasps, 
bees 20' spray stream with quick knock down, 
reasonable residue, high dielectric strength, should not 
harm plastics, EPA registered, 14 oz./can or greater, 12 
cans/case, or equal quality/size product 

5 

SiteOne Landscape 
Supply 

Lesco 11008582 Lesco aerosol wasp and hornet spray   12 5 $113.40 $567.00 

706 

Insect 
Repellant 

Personal use insect repellant for mosquitoes and 
biting flies: gnats, sand flies, no-see-ums, deer flies, 
stable flies, black flies, ticks, chiggers and fleas from 
treated skin and clothing, must spray in any direction, 
non-greasy, sweat resistant, un-scented formula must 
contain 30% DEET minimum, 6 oz./can, 12 cans/case 

1 

SiteOne Landscape 
Supply 

Repel HG-94101 Sportsmen max formula 
 

  12 1 $93.00 $93.00 

707 
Ivy Block Ivy Block Barrier, US Forest Service approved pre-

exposure lotion, FDA approved ivy barrier skin protectant 
against poison ivy, poison oak, and poison sumac, soap 
and water removal, active ingredient: Bentoquatam 5%, 
4 oz./ea., 12/case   

3 

        NO BID 

708 Toilet Bowl 
Mops 

Toilet Bowl Mop, 12" strong I-beam handle, full 4.5“ mop 
head or greater, 24/case, price each 3 ea. Great Western Supply Impact 204 Deluxe Bowl Mop 1 1 1 72 $0.87 $62.64 

709 
20 oz. Mop 8-Ply Cut end cotton mop, 1" headband, white, 16 

lbs./case wt., 12 mops/case   36 
Midland Paper Zephyr Mfg Co 09003 BBL Mop head, cut-end, cotton, 1 ¼” headband, 

white, 20 oz 
1 12 12 36 $26.47 $952.92 

Great Western Supply Prolink W7420 Mop head, cut end, cotton, #20 1 12 12 36 $28.08 $1,010.88 

710 Broom 
 

Corn Straw Broom, 1" diameter wood handle, 23.7 
lbs./case wt., 12 brooms/case 0           
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Miscellaneous Items 
Item 

# Description 
Number 

of 
Cases 

Vendor Manufacturer & 
Brand Stock Number Product Description Items Per 

Pkg 
Pkgs 
Per 

Case 

Items 
Per 

Case 

Number 
Of 

Cases 
Case 
Price Total Price 

711 
24 oz. Mop 8-Ply Cut end cotton mop, 1" headband, white, 12 

mops/case   6 
Midland Paper Zephyr Mfg Co 09005 BBL Mop head, cut-end, cotton, 1 ¼” headband, 

white, 24 oz 
1 12 12 6 $31.00 $186.00 

Great Western Supply Prolink W7424 Mop head, cut end, cotton, #24 1 12 12 6 $33.60 $201.60 

712 
Urinal Screen 

Deodorizing Urinal Screens - no block, cherry, 12/case 12 
Great Western Supply Impact 1401 Urinal screen cherry 1 1 1 144 $0.68 $97.92 
Midland Paper Boardwalk BWK1001 

LAG1001 
Urinal screen, cherry fragrance, red 1 12 12 12 $9.23 $110.76 

713 Trigger 
Sprayers 

General purpose trigger sprayer for 1 quart bottle, price 
each 

268 
ea 

Midland Paper Janico Inc or 
Boardwalk 

1003RW or 
BWK09229 

Trigger sprayer, f/32 oz bottles, red/white, 9 ¼” 
tube 

1 1 24 268 $0.69 $184.92 

Great Western Supply Tolco 206214 Trigger, blue and white, chemical resistant, 9.25 
dip tube 

1 1 1 268 $1.20 $321.60 

714 Dispensing 
Pumps Dispensing pump for 1 gallon jug, price each 10 ea 

Midland Paper Boardwalk BWK00417 
10029897 

Pump 1 oz white, 12/carton 1 12 12 12 ea $3.36 ea $33.60 

Great Western Supply Impact 901 Pump for 1 gal jug 1 1 1 10 NO SAMPLE 

715 

Plastic Bottle 

1 quart bottle for use with trigger sprayer, price each 230 
ea 

Midland Paper Impact Janico Inc or 
Boardwalk 

5032WG1132 or 
BWK00032 
10013680 

Spray bottle, plastic, 32 oz, clear, 24/carton, 
bottle only add item 713 

1 24 24 230 $1.08 ea or full 
cartons $0.86/ea 

$248.40 
$206.40 

Great Western Supply Leading Edge 68W129 32 oz bottle, opaque 1 1 1 230 $1.10 $253.00 

 

 

Disinfectants, Deodorants, and Cleaners 
Item 

# Description 
Number 

of 
Cases 

Vendor MANUFACTURER 
& BRAND 

STOCK 
NUMBER PRODUCT DESCRIPTION ITEMS 

PER PKG 
PKGS 
PER 

CASE 

ITEMS 
PER 

CASE 

NUMBER 
OF 

CASES 
CASE 
PRICE TOTAL PRICE 

801 

Disinfectant 
Cleaner 

Spartan 3251 Hepticide Quat II hospital grade 
disinfectant cleaner, high concentrated broad spectrum 
bactericide, fungicide, virucide, germicide, effective 
against HIV, MRSA, VRE, HBV, E-coli and others, 
neutral pH cleaner/disinfectant for toilet bowls, counters, 
sinks and garbage cans, RTU, 1 qt./bottle, 12 
bottles/case, or equal 

22 

Capital Sanitary Supply Spartan 325103 Hepacide Quat II – 32 oz RTU 32 oz 12 384 oz 22 $17.57 $386.54 
Great Western Supply Spartan 3257 Hepacide Quat II – 32 oz RTU 32 oz 12 384 oz 22 $17.75 $390.50 
Midland Paper Spartan 325103 

QY3251 
Hepacide Quat II – 32 oz RTU w/ 3 trigger 

sprayers 
32 oz 12 384 oz 22 NO SAMPLE 

802 

Disinfectant 
Cleaner 

Hospital Grade Disinfectant Cleaner high concentrated 
broad spectrum bactericide, fungicide, virucide, 
germicide, effective against HIV, MRSA, VRE, HBV, E-
coli and others, neutral pH cleaner/disinfectant for toilet 
bowls, counters, sinks and garbage cans, 1 gal./ea., 4 
/case 

0 

          

803 Disinfectant 
Cleaner 

Non-acid, virucidal, ready to use germicide, cleaner, 
disinfectant, mildewcide, deodorant  
kills (Bacteria): Pseudomonas aeuginosa, 
staphylococcus aureus, Salmonella choleraesuis, 
Streptococcus pyogenes, (Viruses): Herpes Simplex 
Virus type 2, HIV-1 (the AIDS Virus), Influenza Type 
A/Brazil, (Fungi): Aspergillus niger, Trichophyton 
mentagrophytes (Athlete’s Foot Fungus), RTU, 1 
qt./bottle, 12 bottles/case,  Example: Betco 07012 Rest 
Stop Restroom Cleaner 

53 

Great Western Supply Spartan 7116 NABC, Non-Acid Bathroom Disinfectant, 32 oz 
RTU 

32 oz 12 384 oz 53 $17.00 $901.00 

Capital Sanitary Supply Spartan 710603 NABC, Non-Acid Disinfectant Bathroom Cleaner 
– 32 oz RTU 

32 oz 12 384 oz 53 $17.07 $904.71 

Midland Paper Spartan 711603 
QY7116 

Bathroom cleaner RTU, NABC non-acid w/ bowl 
mops 

32 oz 12 384 oz 53 $22.49 $1,191.97 
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Disinfectants, Deodorants, and Cleaners 
Item 

# Description 
Number 

of 
Cases 

Vendor MANUFACTURER 
& BRAND 

STOCK 
NUMBER PRODUCT DESCRIPTION ITEMS 

PER PKG 
PKGS 
PER 

CASE 

ITEMS 
PER 

CASE 

NUMBER 
OF 

CASES 
CASE 
PRICE TOTAL PRICE 

804 Disinfectant 
Cleaner 

Betco 31505 AF315 disinfectant cleaner, pH: 6.5-8.5, 
neutral pH - no harsh alkali to attack floor finish, cleans, 
disinfects and deodorizes in one step, kills HIV-1 (AIDS 
Virus) on pre-cleaned environmental surfaces, citrus 
bouquet fragrance, 5 gal. pail 

20 

Great Western Supply Spartan 1062 DMQ, Neutral disinfectant, 5 gallon bucket 5 gal 1 5 gal 20 $35.55 $711.00 

Greenwood Betco 31505 Betco 31505 Neutral disinfectant – 5 gal 5 gal 1 5 gal 20 $44.05 $881.00 
Midland Paper Spartan 120204 

QY1202 
HDQ neutral disinfectant cleaner 1 gal 4 4 gal 20 NO SAMPLE 

805 

Glass 
Cleaner 

Liquid Glass and Surface Cleaner ready to use with 
trigger sprayer, non-streaking, no residue, 
HMIS Hazard Rating - Flammability =0, Reactivity=0, 
Health=1, 1 qt./bottle, 12 bottles/case 5 

Capital Sanitary Supply Spartan 323903 Bio-Renewable Glass Cleaner – 32 oz RTU 32 oz 12 384 oz 5 $21.23 $106.15 
Great Western Supply Spartan 3239 Bio renewables, glass cleaner, 32 oz RTU 32 oz 12 384 oz 5 $21.47 $107.35 
Midland Paper Spartan 323903 

QY323903 
Glass cleaner bio-renewable RTU, non-VOC 

frangrance-crisp waterfall 
32 oz 12 384 oz 5 NO SAMPLE 

806 

Glass 
Cleaner 

Windex Glass Cleaner  5-gal. bag in box dispenser, 
bag-in-box dispenser of RTU glass cleaner for refilling 
plastic spray bottles, Ammonia-D, streak-free, built-in 
handles, easy-to-pour dispenser spigot, no phosphorous, 
one 5-gal. dispenser/case, or equal 

4 

Midland Paper SC Johnson Windex SJN696502 
AWMDK90122 

Powerized formula glass/surface cleaner, bag-
in-box dispenser 

5 gal 1 5 gal 4 $46.85 $187.40 

807 

Glass 
Cleaner 

Windex Ready-to-Use Glass Cleaner Ammonia-D, 
streak-free, also cleans chrome, stainless steel, 
Plexiglas, and other hard surfaces, 1 gal./bottle ,4 
bottles/case, or equal 

7 
Capital Sanitary Supply Spartan 303004 RTU Glass and Hard Surface Cleaner Gallon 1 gal 4 4 gal 7 $21.00 $147.00 
Great Western Supply Spartan 3030 Glass and hard surface cleaner, RTU, gallons 1 gal 4 4 gal 7 $21.94 $153.58 
Midland Paper Spartan 303004 

111240 
RTU glass and hard surface cleaner, gallon 1 gal 4 4 gal 7 NO SAMPLE 

808 Floor Cleaner Mop-n-Glo floor shine and cleaner, 64 oz./bottle, 6 
bottles/case, NO SUBSTITUTIONS 0           

809 Neutral ph 
cleaner 

Betco 31304-00 lemon neutral pH cleaner, 1 gal./bottle, 
4 bottles/case, or equal 2 

Great Western Supply Spartan 3016 Damp mop neutral cleaner 1 gal 4 4 gal 2 $23.79 $47.58 
Midland Paper Spartan 3016 

QY3016-4 
Damp mop neutral PH cleaner, no rinsing 

required 
1 gal 4 4 gal 2 NO SAMPLE 

810 

All Purpose 
Cleaner 

Clorox 97301 Pinesol “Lavender Clean” All Purpose 
Cleaner 144 fl. oz./bottle, 3 bottles/case,  
NO SUBSTITUTIONS 48 

Capital Sanitary Supply Clorox CL097301 All Purpose Cleaner, Lavender Pine-Sol 144 oz 3 432 oz 48 $25.85 $1,240.80 
Great Western Supply Clorox 97301 All purpose cleaner, pinesol lavender 144 oz 3 432 oz 48 $26.43 $1,268.64 
Midland Paper Clorox CLO97301 

10028693 
All-purpose cleaner, lavender clean pine-sol 144 oz 3 432 oz 48 $26.76 $1,284.48 

811 

All Purpose 
Cleaner Spartan 0035 Clean by Peroxy 1 gal./bottle, 4 

bottles/case, NO SUBSTITUTIONS 12 
Capital Sanitary Supply Spartan 003504 Clean By Peroxy 4-1 gal 1 gal 4 4 gal 12 $46.82 $561.84 
Great Western Supply Spartan 0035 Clean by peroxy 1 gal 4 4 gal 12 $50.86 $610.32 
Midland Paper Spartan 003504 

QY0035-4 
All purpose cleaner, clean by peroxy 1 gal 4 4 gal 12 NO SAMPLE 

812 
Multi- 
Purpose 
Cleaner 

Fabuloso 22 fl. oz./bottle, 12/case, or equal 12 
Midland Paper Colgate-Palmalive CPC53063CT 

10036872 
Multi-use cleaner, lavender scent, Fabuloso 22 oz 12 264 oz 12 $31.94 $383.28 

813 Toilet Bowl 
Cleaner 

Spartan 3530 BioRenewables Restroom Cleaner 1 
qt./bottle, 12 bottles/case, NO SUBSTITUTIONS 6 

Capital Sanitary Supply Spartan 353003 Bio-Renewable Restroom Cleaner 32 oz 12 384 oz 6 $28.50 $171.00 
Great Western Supply Spartan 3530 Bio renewables restroom cleaner RTU 32 oz 12 384 oz 6 $28.80 $172.80 
Midland Paper Spartan 3530 Bathroom cleaner RTU, bio renewables 32 oz 12 384 oz 6 NO SAMPLE 

814 
No Acid 
Toilet Bowl 
Cleaner  

AmSan Renown 111450 REN02836-MS RTU, 1 
qt./bottle, 12 bottles/case, or equal 16 

Great Western Supply Spartan 7116 NABC, non acid restroom disinfectant cleaner 32 oz 12 384 oz 16 $17.00 $272.00 
Midland Paper Spartan 711603 

QY7116 
Bathroom cleaner RTU, NABC non-acid w/ bowl 

mops 
32 oz 12 384 oz 16 $22.49 $359.84 

815 Restroom 
Cleaner 

Betco 33147 green earth restroom cleaner fast draw 
AF79 concentrate, non-acid, 2 L/bottle, 4 bottles/case, or 
equal 

30 

Midland Paper Spartan 711603 
QY7116 

Bathroom cleaner RTU, NABC non-acid w/ 
bowl mops 

32 oz 12 384 oz 30 $22.49 $674.70 

Great Western Supply Spartan 4716 NABC, concentrate, 2 L 2 L 4 8 L 30 $66.36 $1,990.80 
Greenwood Betco 33147 Betco 33147, GE Restroom 4x2L/cs 2 L 4 8 L 30 $75.60 $2,268.00 
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Disinfectants, Deodorants, and Cleaners 
Item 

# Description 
Number 

of 
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Vendor MANUFACTURER 
& BRAND 

STOCK 
NUMBER PRODUCT DESCRIPTION ITEMS 
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PKGS 
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CASE 

NUMBER 
OF 

CASES 
CASE 
PRICE TOTAL PRICE 

816 

Liquid 
Deodorant 

All Purpose Ready To Use Liquid Deodorant, liquid 
squirt-on/spray-on deodorant for use in restrooms to 
control odors, non-staining to fixtures and building, long 
residual life, HMIS Hazard Rating - Flammability =0, 
Reactivity=0, Health=1 or less, include 2 trigger 
sprayers/dozen 

6 

Great Western Supply Spartan 3023 Airlift, fresh scent, liquid deodorizer 32 oz 12 384 oz 6 $22.48 $134.88 
Capital Sanitary Supply Spartan 302303 Airlift Fresh Scent, Liquid Deodorizer, quart 32 oz 12 384 oz 6 NO SAMPLE 
Midland Paper Spartan 3086 Airlift 

QY3086 
Liquid deodorant RTU, Airlift - quart 32 oz 12 384 oz 6 NO SAMPLE 

817 

Commercial 
Disinfecting 
Surface 
Wipes 

Pre-moistened disinfecting wipes, 7” x 8” wipe, 75 
wipes/pkg., 12 pkgs./case, Net Wt. 1.17 lbs., or equal 71 

Great Western Supply Aktive AKTIVE Disinfecting wipes, 6.5” x 7” 500 6 3000 21.3 DNMS 
Midland Paper Reckitt-Benckiser RAC99716 

10073019 
6.75” x 8.75” disinfecting wipes, Lysol lemon 
and lime blossom scent, flat pack, effective 
against SARS-CoV-2, the virus that causes 

COVID-19, in 2 minutes when used as directed 
on hard, non-porous surfaces. 

80 6 480 134 $36.73 $4,921.82 

  

Hand and Body Soaps; Lotions & Sanitizers 
Item 

# Description 
Number 

of 
Cases 

Vendor 
 

MANUFACTURER 
& BRAND 

STOCK 
NUMBER PRODUCT DESCRIPTION ITEMS 

PER PKG 
PKGS 
PER 

CASE 

ITEMS 
PER 

CASE 

NUMBER 
OF 

CASES 
CASE 
PRICE TOTAL PRICE 

901 

Foam Hand 
Cleaner Pro-Link Optimum RH250 foaming pink skin cleanser, 

1,250 mL/ea., 3/case, NO SUBSTITUTIONS 8 

Great Western Supply Prolink MRH250 (old 
number now 
discontinued, 

same product, but 
4/cs) 

Optimum lotion soap 1250 mL 4 5000 mL 6 $78.95 $473.70 

902 Foam Hand 
Cleaner 

Pro-Link FreeHands FH125 luxury foam soap refill, 
Green Seal Certified, 1,200 mL/ea., 2/case 0           

903 Foam Hand 
Soap 

Betco Clario 78129-00 green foaming hand soap, 
EcoLogo & Green Seal Certified, 1000 mL/ea., 6/case,  
NO SUBSTITUTIONS 

1 
Greenwood Betco 78129 Betco 78129, Green Foam 6x1000mL/cs 1000 mL 6 6000 mL 1 $57.50 $57.50 

904 
Foam Hand 
Soap 

Buckeye Symmetry 9009-1120 green certified foam 
hand wash, Green Seal Certified, 1,250 mL/ea., 6/case, 
NO SUBSTITUTIONS 

7 
Great Western Supply Buckeye 9009-1120 Symmetry Green Cert. foam soap 1250 mL 6 7500 mL 7 $63.00 $441.00 

905 
Foam 
Hair/Body 
Shampoo 

Betco Clario 74629-00 ocean blue hair & body 
shampoo, 1,000 mL/ea., 6/case, NO SUBSTITUTIONS 0 

          

906 
Foam Hair & 
Body 
Cleanser 

Pro-Link Optimum SH250 foaming green hair & body 
cleanser, 1,250 mL/ea., 3/case, NO SUBSTITUTIONS 0 

          

907 Liquid Hand 
Soap 

Betco Winning Hands Pink Lotion 11219, 900 mL/box, 
12 boxes/case, NO SUBSTITUTIONS 0           

908 Liquid Hand 
Soap 

Tork Meyon 55 Lotion Soap 400011S 33.8 oz./bottle, 6 
bottles/case 6 Great Western Supply Tork 400011 Meron 55 lotion soap 1 L 6 6 L 6 $38.25 $229.50 

Midland Paper Tork Meyon 55 400011 Premium extra mild lotion soap 1 L 6 6 L 6 $39.13 $234.78 

909 
Liquid Hand 
Soap 

Pearl Coconut scented liquid hand soap, 1 gal./bottle, 4 
bottles/case, or equal 29 Capital Sanitary Supply Spartan 323004 Pearlay Pearlized Hand Cleaner 1 gal 4 4 gal 29 $28.80 $835.20 

Great Western Supply Spartan 3230 Pearlux liquid hand soap 1 gal 4 4 gal 29 $31.40 $910.60 

910 Bar Hand 
Soap Lava 10383 bar hand soap, 4 oz./bar, 48 bars/case 0 Midland Paper WD40 Co WDF10383 

BS141051 
Lava bars 10383 4 oz 48 48 10 $49.74 $497.40 

911 
Pre-
moistened 
hand towels 

ITW Dymon 42272 Scrubs-In-A-Bucket hand cleaner 
towels, 10.5” x 12.25” towel, 72 towels/pkg.,  
6 pkgs./case, 432 towels/case 

7 
Midland Paper Scrubs Pro Brand ITW42272CT 

LAG42272 
Wipes, handcleaner, bucket, dymon-scrubs-in-a-

bucket, 10.5” x 12.25” 
72 6 432 7 $88.29 $618.03 
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912 
Pre-
moistened 
hand towels 

Brawny 21501 industrial wet hand towel, 84 towels/pkg., 
6 pkgs./case, 504 towels/case 15 

Midland Paper Georgia-Pacific 
Brawny 

21501 
10001403 

Wipes, handcleaner, bucket, blue wet hand 
towels, 8.6” x 12.2” 

84 6 504 15 $70.86 $1,062.90 

913 

Hand 
Sanitizer 

Dial 2340000213 clear gel hand sanitizer w/ moisturizer, 
16 fl. oz./ea., 8/case, must be FDA approved and not on 
any banned item or recall list, current FDA hand sanitizer 
recall list: https://www.fda.gov/drugs/drug-safety-and-
availability/fda-updates-hand-sanitizers-consumers-
should-not-use#products,  
must not contain methanol, must be minimum 62% Ethyl 
or Isopropyl Alcohol, or equal 

74 

Midland Paper Dial Corp DIA00213 
10048701 

Clear gel hand sanitizer w/ moisturizer 16 oz 8 128 oz 74 $51.58 $3,816.92 

Greenwood Betco 796E9 Betco 70% alcohol gel, 12x500mL/cs 
(12x16.9oz/cs) 

500 mL, 
16.9 oz 

12 6000 mL 46 $105.00 $4,830.00 

Great Western Supply Buckeye 9019-0050 Foaming, fragrance free, hand sanitizer, 550 
mL (18.6 oz), 917 pumps per bottle 

550 mL, 
18.6 oz 

12 6600 mL, 
223.2 oz 

43 $129.45 $5,566.35 

914 
Foam Hair & 
Body 
Shampoo 

Pro-Link Optimum SH220 foaming green hair & body 
cleanser, 2,000 mL/ea., 2/case, NO SUBSTITUTIONS 70 

Great Western Supply Prolink SH220 Optimum hair and body 2000 mL 2 4000 mL 70 $46.21 $3,234.70 

 
Notes:  
 
Items missing samples are shaded light gray. 
Vendors have been contacted about missing samples. 
 
Great Western Supply: Item #202 “availability may be affected by COVID” 

“Gloves of all types have been affected by COVID. We have bid the gloves we feel are the most readily available, but there may still be extended lead times.” 
 
Midland Paper: “Midland Paper reserves the right to declare “force majeure” if market conditions dictate. There are many items that can’t be guaranteed they will be available any time soon – gloves, disinfectants, a 
lot of the chemicals. The quotes are based on what is available today, and we all know what happened in 2020.” 
 
Items that Do Not Meet Specs: 
 
108 Midland Paper: Not 425’ (350’) 
109 Great Western Supply: No Substitutions (Essity) 
109 JP Gasway: No Substitutions (Nova) 
109 BL Murray: No Substitutions (Vondrehle) 
202 Great Western Supply: 1 ply not 4 ply 
302 JP Gasway: Roll width 4.5” not 4” 
302 BL Murray: Roll width 4.5” not 4” 
502 Midland Paper: Size 
614 Great Western Supply: Synthetic vinyl not nitrile 
817 Great Western Supply: Package quantity (500) is too large to be useful to most participants 

https://www.fda.gov/drugs/drug-safety-and-availability/fda-updates-hand-sanitizers-consumers-should-not-use#products
https://www.fda.gov/drugs/drug-safety-and-availability/fda-updates-hand-sanitizers-consumers-should-not-use#products
https://www.fda.gov/drugs/drug-safety-and-availability/fda-updates-hand-sanitizers-consumers-should-not-use#products

