
Unit Price Net Bid Unit Price Net Bid Unit Price Net Bid

1.1 36" x 9" Green with White Border 50 EA $17.90 $895.00 $2.68 $134.00 $38.25 $1,912.50

1.2 3" x 2.5" WARNING - Sticker, Pressure Sensitive (See attached 500 EA $0.25 $125.00 $2.25 $1,125.00 $1.25 $625.00

1.3 36" x 9" Green with White Border Avenue (with Rock Island Log 200 EA $24.20 $4,840.00 $5.32 $1,064.00 $38.25 $7,650.00

1.4 36" x 9" Green with White Border Street (with Rock IslandLogo 200 EA $24.20 $4,840.00 $5.32 $1,064.00 $38.28 $7,656.00
1.5 12" x 6" White - Red outline and Red Arrow IL Code:DA-18L 100 EA $5.95 $595.00 $0.60 $60.00 $6.00 $600.00

$11,295.00 $3,447.00 $18,443.50

11/18/2021

MDSolutionsDescription UOM

Joint Purchasing Council - 2022 Street Signs and Sign Materials Bid Tabulation
BID OPENING NOVEMBER 16, 2021

GROUP ONE: ALUMINUM SIGN BLANKS
Bid 

Line #

TOTAL GROUP 1

Iowa Prison Industries Vulcan IncTotal Quantity



Unit Price Net Bid Unit Price Net Bid Unit Price Net Bid
2.1 12" x 6" 3 Way IL Code:R1-

3 5 EA $2.00 $10.00 $0.85 $4.25 $2.00 $10.00

2.2 18" x 6" All Way IL 
Code:R1-4 10 EA $2.40 $24.00 $1.27 $12.70 $2.63 $26.30

2.3 30" x 30" Two Way Traffic 
IL Code:W6-3 5 EA $19.65 $98.25 $10.56 $52.80 $18.75 $93.75

2.4 18" x 18" End of Road 
Marker (Red) 20 EA $7.15 $143.00 $3.80 $76.00 $6.75 $135.00

$145.75

11/18/2021

$275.25

GROUP TWO: TRAFFIC SIGN FACES  - HIGH INTENSITY
Iowa Prison Industries Vulcan Inc MDSolutionsTotal 

Quantity
Bid Line 

# Description UOM

$265.05TOTAL GROUP 2 



Unit Price Net Bid Unit Price Net Bid Unit Price Net Bid
3.1 90 Degree post cap for 3# for U-Channel post, 12" slot 

flat - 91UF0190 100 EA $21.20 $2,120.00 $12.15 $1,215.00 $9.75 $975.00

3.2

Die Cuts Pressure Sensitive, non reflective, White, 6" 
Series B , 25 per package.  Quantity for each letter: A- 
B- C- D- E- F- G- H- I- J- K- L- M- N- O- P- Q- R- S- T- 
U- V- W- X- Y- Z-

1 Package $15.00 $15.00 No Bid No Bid $15.00 $15.00

3.3
Die Cuts Pressure Sensitive, non reflective, White, 6" 
Series B , 25 per package.  Quantity for each number: 
0- 1- 2- 3- 4- 5- 6- 7- 8- 9-

1 Package $15.00 $15.00 No Bid No Bid $15.00 $15.00

3.4 12” Cross flat slot 150 EA $12.20 $1,830.00 $12.15 $1,822.50 $9.75 $1,462.50
3.5 12” Round Post Flat Slot 2 3/8" OD pole 50 EA $20.00 $1,000.00 $12.15 $607.50 $9.75 $487.50

11/18/2021

Bid 
Line #

$2,955.00

GROUP THREE: HARDWARE

TOTAL GROUP 3 

Iowa Prison Industries Vulcan Inc MDSolutionsTotal 
Quantity UOM

$4,980.00 $3,645.00

Description



Price per 
Unit Net Bid Price per 

Unit Net Bid Price per 
Unit Net Bid

4.1
12" x 18" No Parking Symbol 
(Blank under the symbol. See 
attached photo) IL Code:R7-2

100 EA $9.65 $965.00 $11.38 $1,138.00 $9.71 $971.00

4.2
18" x 18" End of road marker 
(Red) No Reflectors IL 
Code:OM4-3

10 EA $14.95 $149.50 $16.25 $162.50 $14.56 $145.60

4.3
24" x 30" SPEED LIMIT 20 
(High Int. Prismatic) IL 
Code:R2-1

5 EA $33.20 $166.00 $29.30 $146.50 $32.35 $161.75

4.4 24" x 48" Left-Right arrow 
Yellow IL Code:W1-7 5 EA $53.05 $265.25 $46.88 $234.40 $51.76 $258.80

4.5 30" x 30" Loose Gravel IL 
Code:W8-7 5 EA $41.50 $207.50 $36.63 $183.15 $40.44 $202.20

4.6 30" x 30" No Outlet IL 
Code:W14-2 5 EA $41.50 $207.50 $36.63 $183.15 $40.44 $202.20

4.7 30" x 30" Dead End IL 
Code:W14-1 5 EA $41.50 $207.50 $36.63 $183.15 $40.44 $202.20

4.8 30" x 30" Octagon - STOP IL 
Code:R1-1 100 EA $33.05 $3,305.00 $34.91 $3,491.00 $32.50 $3,250.00

4.9 30" x 30" DO NOT ENTER IL 
Code:R5-1 10 EA $41.50 $415.00 $37.83 $378.30 $40.44 $404.40

4.10 18 x 12 Handicap right arrow 
IL Code:R7-8R 10 EA $10.00 $100.00 $11.38 $113.80 $9.71 $97.10

4.11
18 x 12 Merge Right (symbol) 
(Orange  Black) IL Code:R7-
8L

15 EA $10.00 $150.00 $11.38 $170.70 $9.71 $145.65

11/18/2021

GROUP FOUR A : READY MADE SIGNS ON ALUMINUM BLANKS - HIGH INTENSITY PRISMATIC

Total Quantity UOM
Vulcan IncIowa Prison Industries MDSolutions

DescriptionBid 
Line #

TOTAL GROUP 4A $6,384.65$6,138.25 $6,040.90



Price per 
Unit Net Bid Price per 

Unit Net Bid Price per 
Unit Net Bid

5.1 12" x 18" NO PARKING SYMBOL with "TO 
CORNER" IL Code:R7-2A 50 EA $7.25 $362.50 $7.85 $392.50 $9.38 $469.00

5.2 18" x 24" One Way Arrow (Right) IL 
Code:R6-2R 15 EA $16.30 $244.50 $16.38 $245.70 $18.75 $281.25

5.3 21" x 15" Directional Arrow Left 45 Degree IL 
Code:M6-2L 15 EA $11.90 $178.50 $15.87 $238.05 $13.67 $205.05

5.4 30" x 30" STOP IL Code:R1-1 100 EA $24.75 $2,475.00 $31.63 $3,163.00 $32.00 $3,200.00

11/18/2021

GROUP 4B: READY MADE SIGNS ALUMINUM BLANKS - ENGINEER GRADE

Bid 
Line # Description Total Quantity UOM

Iowa Prison Industries Vulcan Inc MDSolutions

TOTAL GROUP 4B $3,260.50 $4,039.25 $4,155.30


